
 

9 years of professional experience as 

• Salesforce Developer (Apirl-2021 to till date), 

Software Developer (Dec-2019 to April-2021) at Pegasus 

Technologies and Softwares Pvt. Ldt. Nagpur.  

• Junior Web Developer (Oct-2017 to Dec-2019) at Isha 

TechnoHub Pvt. Ltd., Nagpur. 

• Software Trainer (Aug-2013 to Oct-2017) at ICE COMPUTERS, 

Nagpur. 
 

 Salesforce Developer 

• Experience in Both Sales cloud and Service Cloud 
implementations, salesforce.com (Classic, lightning aura and 
LWC). 

• Experience in developing custom pages using LWC and 
custom CSS. 

• Experience in Salesforce Lightning UI, building components, 
design standard, custom flexi Home, App, Record pages, 
Profiles, Roles, Users, Page Layouts, Record Types, Email 
Services, Approvals, Reports, Dashboards. 

• Worked on Workflow rule, Approval Process and Process 
Builder & Flow builder. 

• Good experience in designing of custom objects, custom 
fields, custom Tabs, custom reports, report folders, report 
extractions to various formats. 

• Worked on Relationship (Lookup and master-Details), 
Designed Junction objects and implemented various advanced 
fields like Pick list, Custom Formula Fields, Field Dependencies, 
Validation rule. 

• Experience in SFDC development using Visualforce Pages, 
Apex Classes, Controllers, Triggers, Batch apex, Schema 
builder, SOQL, SOSL and various other components as per the 
client and application requirements. 

• Created VF pages, Apex Controllers, calling VF page into a 

lightning page. 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

Er. Prashil Shahakar 
Salesforce Developer 

+91 - 88888 07467 

prashil.developer 
   @gmail.com 

03, Vaibhav Nagar, 
Wanadongri, Hingna 

Road, Nagpur-441110. 

Highly motivated team player with excellent communication, 

presentation and interpersonal skills. Willing to work with 

challenging and cross-platform environment in an organization 

which provides me an opportunity to grow as a professional as 

well as an individual where my potentials can be 

completely utilized to achieve the organizational goal. 

WORK EXPERIENCE 

ABOUT ME 

SKILLS 

Salesforce – Salesforce 

CRM, Lightning aura apps, 

Lightning LWC Apps, 

SOQL, SOSL, Visual Studio 

Code, Workbench. 

Programming – Apex, 

Java, C, C++, Python. 

Web Technologies - HTML, 

CSS, JavaScript, Bootstrap, 

PHP. 

Operating Systems -

Windows, MAC OS.  

Database – SQL. 

Others – AutoCAD, 

Microsoft Office Tools. 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

• Worked on Custom label, Email Template, Custom settings, 

Page layout, Profile, Data Security model, field level access, 

record access and sharing rules. 

• Well familiar with Workbench tool. 

• Implemented Agile Methodology as a part of Project 

Managements. 

• Good Interpersonal skills, commitment, result oriented, hard 

working with a quest and zeal to learn new technologies. 

 Software Developer and Junior Web Developer 

• Experience in creating java classes, interfaces, threads, AWT 
applets, swing based applications with data validations. 

• Experience in creating java application using swing and SQL. 

• Experience in using Xampp server for creating database, 
tables. 

• Experience in creating dynamic webpages using PHP, SQL, 
JavaScript, HTML, and CSS. 

• Experience in Using JavaScript events to manipulate the 
elements depending on the user interactions. 

• Involving in developing HTML and JavaScript for client-side 

presentation and, data validation on the client side within the 

forms. 

• Using JavaScript, HTML, and CSS for developing single page 

application and achieving two-way data binding between HTML 

and JavaScript objects. 

• Using JavaScript DOM manipulation and JavaScript event to 

generate the data result in UI. 

• Played a vital role in defining, implementing and enforcing 

quality practices in the team organization to ensure internal 

controls, quality and compliance policies and standards. 

• Preparing weekly project report that includes test coverage 

and status reports. 

Software Trainer 

• Experience in teaching programming technologies – 

C Prog., C++, Java, HTML, CSS, BS, JavaScript, SQL, Python. 

• Have taken workshops & guest lectures in colleges on 

various programming technologies and project development. 

HOBBIES 

STRENGTH 

LANGUAGES 

• Playing Cricket 

• Reading 

• Art and Craft  

• Confident 

• Positive Outlook 

• Self-Motivator 

• Team Facilitator 

• Problem Solving Ability 

• Quick Learner 

• English 

• Marathi 

• Hindi 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

PROJECT #01  Responsibilities 

• Configured Page Layouts, Record Types, Managing Fields 
and their dependencies, Tabs, Search Layouts and Button & 
Links. 

• Implemented different lightning components, written 
business logic in Apex Controller. 

• Configured and Set up relationship between various objects. 

•  Creating Workflows, Objects and Validation Rules inside 
Salesforce and Mapping them to the existing functionalities 
and Objects. 

• Built Enhanced Dashboards in SFDC. 

• Worked on Reports & Dashboards. 

• Implemented complete Salesforce CRM application based 
on the Business requirements.  

• Created and managed Users, Roles, Profiles, Permissions, 
mass updates and renaming records. 

• Worked on various salesforce.com standard objects like 
Accounts, Contacts, Leads, Campaigns, Opportunities, Quotes, 
Activities, Dashboards and Reports. 

• Used the sandbox for testing and migrated the code to the 
deployment instance after testing. 

 Project Description 

It’s an online application that captures lead from web-to-lead 

process & converting bulk lead through automation that helps 

to grow business then maintain lead conversion Process and 

provides partner portal as well as Customer portal to 

communicate with the industry. As well as it also analyse 

reports of the growth of industry by considering which 

Distributor, dealer, Retailer is good in which product and how 

much revenue they generated & with help of Salesforce 

analytics shown reports & dashboard. 

Role: Salesforce Developer 

Domain: Electronic Goods 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

PROJECT #02 

Role: Salesforce Developer 

Domain: Pharmaceutical 

 Responsibilities 

• Involved in study/analysis of business functional 
specifications document. 

• Implemented Apex Triggers, Apex controllers, Visual force 
pages and Email templates. 

• Implemented E-mail notification to the group when 
governor limits reached. 

•  Public Groups and workflows, Process Builder 

• Involved in Data Migration process through bulk API 

• Involved in Code Integration and unit testing and Bug Fixing. 

• Involved in code migrating from one sandbox to another 
sandbox usingForce.com IDE (Eclipse). 

• Involved in Code review, optimization and fixing review 
comments. 

 Project Description 

It was developed to automate business process. The five 

different modules are individually connected with force.com 

platform. The customer can buy products through the 

pharmacy CRM, and payment is also carried out through the 

payment system which is very useful for the customers. We can 

also check the current status of the stock which is updated for 

each and every second. 

Role: Jr. Web Developer 

Domain: Websites 

WEB PROJECTS  Responsibilities 

• Experience in developing consumer-focused websites using 

HTML, CSS, BS, PHP and JavaScript. 

• Built products for desktop and mobile app users meeting 

highest standards for web design, user experience and best 

practices. 

• Maintained and updated customer websites as needed. 

• Performed weekly assessments of all websites to look for 

potential problems or crashes. 



 

 EDUCATIONAL QUALIFICATION 

 Year 2016, B.E. (CSE) 

Dr. Babasaheb Ambedkar College of Engg. & Research, Nagpur. 

Rashtrasanth Tukdoji Maharaj Nagpur University, Maharashtra. 

 Year 2008, Diploma in Engg. (CT) 

G. H. Raisoni Polytechnic, Nagpur. 

MSBTE, Mumbai, Maharashtra. 

 Year 2005, S.S.C.  

Nehru Vidhyalaya Hingna, Nagpur. 

Maharashtra State Board, Nagpur Division. 

 PERSONAL DETAILS 

Name     :  Er. Prashil P. Shahakar 

Father’s Name  : Pradip H. Shahakar 

Mother’s Name : Shobha P. Shahakar 

Date of Birth    :  18/07/1989 

Marital Status    : Married 

Address    : 03, Vaibhav Nagar, Wanadongri, Hingna 

    Road, Nagpur, Maharashtra, India. 

Pin code    :  441110 

Email     :  prashil.developer@gmail.com 

Mobile     :  +91 – 88888 07467 

 

Date :   10/07/2022 

Place :   Nagpur 

Yours Faithfully, 

Er. Prashil P. Shahakar 


